
hours or days instead of the months that can in­
tervene between starting and concluding a re­
search project. The desirable habit of follow-up 
with a preparedness to react to interval develop­
ments in behalf of a patient perhaps sets the stage 
for what Slatkoff, et al. eventually recognized was 
a mistaken decision to intervene with patients 
serving as controls in their study. 

Ambiguity and uncertainty are inherent to the 
nature of primary care, and much of the research 
that is needed will of necessity grapple with this 
ambiguity. It seems likely that no amount of an­
ticipation can predict all the variance and unex­
pected events that will occur during a well-con­
ceived investigation executed in family practice 
settings. These unexpected events might require 
responses that readily can be made in the context 
of a known past and an anticipated future involv­
ing patient, clinician, and staff. 

So far, much practice-based research has been 
done without alteration of care and without iden­
tification of physician or patient. Data that would 
have been collected anyway form the substrate for 
investigation, with the assumption that the con­
sent patients give by seeking care is sufficient and 
exempts such research from further special proced­
ures. Inevitably, probing beyond descriptions 
leads to a need for prospective data collection 
linked to individuals, and more intervention re­
search is needed in family practices. It seems the 
time has arrived for careful consideration to be 
given to the mechanisms that should be used to 
assure research done "among friends" in ongoing 
relationships is promoted by practical and achiev­
able methods that protect patients who depend 
upon practices, which are also laboratorLeJl. 

We suggest that there is a need for further at­
tention to the establishment of standards for the 
ethical conduct of practice-based research. Not 
being expert in this area, we suspect such stand­
ards will almost certainly replicate much of what 
has evolved for the rest of medical research. It is 
possible that on careful reflection, nothing addi­
tional will be required. It seems to us, however, 
that research occurring within the context of an 
ongoing physician-patient relationship will re­
quire some special consideration. 

Larry A. Green, MD 
Paul A. Nutting, MD, MPH 

Denver, CO 
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Planning For The Unknown 
In Research: Ethical 
Dilemmas Confronting 
The Clinician-Investigator 

~edi~al history is replete with examples of ways 
III whIch concern about risks and respect for the 
patient-subject have been allowed to erode in the 
name of science. I,2 The recent revelation by the 
federal government regarding questionable ex­
periments ~th plutonium on unsuspecting and 
un consentIng human subjects, particularly in 
case~ where the subjects were considered a captive 
or dIsadvantaged class, demonstrates the fragile 
nature of the moral safeguards supposedly in 
place for the protection of patients and research 
subjects. In this issue of JABFP, Slatkoff, Curtis, 
and Coker's thoughtful article highlights at least 
two difficult problems facing clinician-investiga­
tors who enroll their patients in a research study.3 
The first problem focuses on the content of 
inf~r~~d c?nsen~ and the level of knowledge 
a clIniCian-Investigator should attain about a 
r~search. project in order to inform the prospec­
tive patient-subject fully about uncertainties 

Submitted, revised, 7 March 1994. 
From the Center for Applied Professional Ethics, Department of 
Philosophy, University of Tennessee, Knoxville. Address reprint 
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that could materialize during the course of the 
study. The second addresses conflict of interest 
issues that confront many clinician-investigators 
today. 

Informed Consent and Unknown Risks 
Few ethical and legal issues surrounding the medi­
cal profession are as much discussed and as little 
understood as informed consent. The basic 
premise of this doctrine is that informed consent 
must be the willing and uncoerced acceptance of 
a medical procedure by a patient after adequate 
disclosure by the physician of the nature of the 
procedure, its risks and benefits, and the alterna­
tives available with their risks and benefits.4 Even 
though considerably less has been written about 
informed consent in the research setting, there is 
a clear consensus that a more complete disclosure 
of information should be required than that re­
quired in the clinical setting.s 

Slatkoff, Curtis, and Coker appear to travel be­
yond what most institutional review boards 
(IREs) and clinician-investigators would feel 
comfortable with in suggesting that informed 
consent in research should be based on a compre­
hension of all ramifications of the procedure in 
question, including an understanding of the pa­
rameters of the unknown risks associated with the 
study. Focusing too long, however, on the ques­
tion of unknown risks can quickly cast the clini­
cian-investigator and his or her patient into a sea 
of confusion. Unknown risks might be consider­
able in any experimental procedure, and a pro­
spective patient-subject might not have the back­
ground to be able to formulate the questions 
needed for a fully informed consent. 

To what extent, then, should a patient be in­
formed about the uncertainties of a study? Is the 
statement required by Department of Health 
and Human Services rules and regulations in all 
government funded research " ... that the particu­
lar procedure may involve risks to the subject 
which are currently unforeseeable," sufficient in 
the situations envisioned by Slatkoff and her 
colleagues?t'i 

The concept of informed consent assumes that 
the party seeking consent understands the study 
design, knows whether it is good or bad science, 
and is prepared to inform the patient-subject fully 
on the proposed methodologies, the scientific end 
being sought, and the benefits and risks associated 
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with achieving that end. Does this assumption in­
clude unknown risks? Well, yes and no. Yes, if the 
unknown risks should have been anticipated; that 
is, they are logically connected or associated with 
the nature of the study even though unknown at 
the time. The study set forth in the article in 
question is a very good example of this connec­
tion. There the unknown role of various potential 
factors, including human papillomavirus (HPV), 
in the development of cervical intraepithelial neo­
plasia was the topic of the study, yet HPV was not 
specifically described in the consent form and, 
therefore, presumably not discussed with the pa­
tients to be enrolled in the study. On the other 
hand, there are some unknown risks that defy any 
comprehension or association and fall clearly out­
side the disclosure requirements of the informed 
consent process. What is important about this 
issue is not only the level of competency that 
should be required of all clinician-investigators 
who enroll patients in research studies but also 
the way they go about informing their patients 
about unknown risks. 

Two things are critical here. First, many clini­
cians and investigators still believe that once a re­
viewing IRE approves and signs off on the in­
formed consent form, an ethical and legal 
informed consent is achieved when the form is 
signed by the patient or patient's surrogate. An in­
formed consent form proves only that consent oc­
curred; it does not prove that consent was in­
formed. 7 It is the process of communication, the 
explanation of the contents of the document, that 
satisfies the informed element of consent. 

The second thing is dealing with the element 
of uncertainty that pervades nearly all research 
studies. Many clinician-investigators fear ac­
knowledging uncertainty to themselves, to their 
colleagues, and to their patients. As a result, this 
fear can be carried into the study. For example, 
many physicians remain unconvinced that they 
should inform patient-subjects in randomized 
clinical trials that their therapy will be decided by 
chance.s In Jay Katz's8 view, the problem posed by 
uncertainty is not so much how to inform the pa­
tient about it but how to keep the existence of un­
certainty clearly in mind and not replace it with 
certainty when one moves from theoretical to 
practical consideration. Central to this valid 
premise is the important admonition of the au­
thors that regardless of the nature of uncertainty, 

 on 12 M
ay 2025 by guest. P

rotected by copyright.
http://w

w
w

.jabfm
.org/

J A
m

 B
oard F

am
 P

ract: first published as 10.3122/jabfm
.7.3.263 on 1 M

ay 1994. D
ow

nloaded from
 

http://www.jabfm.org/


such as unknown risk, the clinician-investigator 
should be prepared to deal with the problem 
should it materialize. This preparation includes a 
clear understanding as to when and how the study 
will be terminated if the best interests of the pa­
tient-subjects are threatened. 

Conflict of Interest in Research 
The second problem addressed by Slatkoff, Cur­
tis, and Coker interfaces with informed consent 
and highlights the increasingly important conflict 
of interest issue facing clinician-investigators to­
day. Without question, the investigator's interest 
in research has become an important issue from 
the patient's viewpoint, and Slatkoff and her col­
leagues should be commended for demonstrating 
that the problem is always before an investigator, 
even in a fairly simple and straightforward study. 

Generally we think of a conflict of interest aris­
ing when clinician-investigators are engaged in 
research involving a particular drug or medical 
device, and they receive remuneration from, or 
own stock in, the company that manufactures the 
drug or medical device. This area is only one in 
which a conflict of interest might exist, however. 
Participating in research offers several benefits to 
an investigator that are not always beneficial (or 
obvious) to the patient. It is not unreasonable to 
suppose that scientific interests, academic reputa­
tions, increased prospects for tenure, and institu­
tional pride might not always coincide with the 
best interests of the patient involved in clinical 
research. 

In response to this difficult issue, the authors 
mention one possible solution, the establishment 
of independent data-monitoring commiwes who 
are the sole bearers of on-going study results. 
With such a committee in place, a clinician-inves­
tigator could not intervene or terminate a study 
because of discovery of a superior therapy or sig­
nificant laboratory findings in epidemiological 
studies unless authorized to do so by the commit­
tee. The desired effect is to alleviate the conflict 
of interest that some clinician-investigators experi­
ence between continuing a study and protecting 
the best interests of the patient. While establish­
ing an independent data-monitoring committee 
is an interesting and noteworthy proposition, it 
has its own problems. 

Such a committee, for example, would have no 
affect on the "real" conflict of interest question. A 

clinician-investigator cannot assign (and thereby 
free himself or herself from) the constellation of 
moral and legal obligations that society imposes 
on physician-patient relationships or investiga­
tor-patient relationships. Given that a patient's 
best interests not only are basic to the standard of 
care required of a clinician-investigator from a 
legal perspective but, more importantly, form the 
moral core of that relationship, the clinician-in­
vestigator will always .be charged with the respon­
sibility to intervene in the course of a study if a 
superior therapy or medical knowledge is uncov­
ered that will prevent the patient from suffering 
harm. Even if the committee entered into an in­
demnifying agreement with the investigator, such 
that the committee would become the primary 
responsible party much as a principal-agent or 
master-servant relationship, the clinician-investi­
gator would still remain legally and morally ac­
countable for her or his own acts. In view of this 
continuing responsibility, it would be quite fool­
ish for any clinician-investigator to surrender the 
right to terminate a study where the best interests 
of the patient are at stake. If, however, an investi­
gator does not desire to terminate a study, even 
though it would benefit the patient to do so, re­
search institutions could have in place proper 
controls for directing the investigator to do so. 
This scenario is quite different from being told 
you cannot intervene on behalf of the patient­
subject unless authorized by a committee to do so. 

The issues discussed here with respect to clini­
cian-investigators apply to some degree to all 
medical investigators, because they derive from 
the underlying ethical obligation to promote the 
patient's welfare in the best manner possible. To 
achieve that end today, clinician-investigators 
must realize that when determining what infor­
mation about unknown risks should be disclosed, 
the standards provided in ethical codes and regu­
lations are not particularly instructive. Informed 
consent to research is a very formal process and 
involves a complex set of obligations about disclo­
sure of information and education of the patient. 
To that end, clinician-investigators should strive 
to develop a comprehensive account of the ele­
ments of informed consent for presentation to 
prospective patient-subjects. 

Frank H. Marsh,]D, PhD 
Knoxville, TN 
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Designing Research On 
Health Risk Behaviors: 
Questioning the 
Assumptions 

The report "Associations with High-Risk Sexual 
Behavior" in this issue by Steiner and his col­
leagues! raises many issues that invite further 
discussion and exploration. Certainly, with the 
rise in rates of persons positive for human immuno­
deficiency virus (HIV) infection, research on un­
derstanding primary prevention of this disease is 
timely and relevant. 

Early attempts at research into the behavioral 
correlates of population groups with dispropor­
tionately high HIV positivity rates initially fo­
cused on the information base of the population. 
Since then, several well-documented studies have 
reported that information by itself is not suffi­
cient to prompt behavioral change that protects 
against HIV exposure.2,3 
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This finding that information is not sufficient 
to change behavior should come as no surprise. 
We have, over the years, ample evidence that 
knowledge of adverse effects of tobacco use, driv­
ing while under the inBuence of alcohol or other 
drugs, sedentariness, and dietary excessive fat, all 
of which result in risk to health in the long run, do 
not predictably motivate persons to change their 
behavior. 

The next question becomes, if information is 
not enough, what then is needed additionally for 
individuals to make good decisions about protect­
ing themselves against life-threatening illness? 

One of the difficulties of past research in this 
area is that we have assumed that there is one cen­
tral reason persons engage in behaviors that jeop­
ardize health. We keep looking for the "magic 
bullets" that, if discovered, would allow us to de­
sign programs which keep populations from tak­
ing risks with their health. Unfortunately, the so­
lution is not so simple. There is neither one 
reason nor one intervention that will address the 
problem of HIV prevention or the prevention of 
other diseases when it is within an individual's 
power to protect his or her health. The reasons 
African-American men, African-American wom­
en, white women, Hispanic women, and others 
jeopardize their health and expose themselves 
unnecessarily to HIV are multiple and complex; 
they are rooted in reasons that can be viewed 
from three perspectives: the individual perspec­
tive, the family or social unit perspective, and a 
larger societal perspective. 

At the individual level, actions about health be­
havior are influenced by information (both accu­
rate and inaccurate), by the belief that the infor­
mation pertains to oneself (sense of vulnerability 
or invulnerability), by the motivation to protect 
one's health (belief that one's life is worth protect­
ing), and by the freedom and ability to make good 
choices about health. This latter issue is an area of 
skill development particularly pertinent for ado­
lescents. Many young persons know the correct 
information, might or might not believe that it 
pertains to them, wish to be healthy into adult­
hood, but lack the interpersonal skills to say "no" 
to a partner pressing for sexual intercourse with­
out a condom. 

At the social unit and family level, the factors 
that most commonly affect health risk of individ­
uals are peer or group norms (belief and accept-
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